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Sample itinerary is subject to weather conditions and may
differ from actual days spent in each location.
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Fethiye-Oludeniz-Butterfly
Valley-Kalkan-Kekova-Demre-
Kaputaş Beach-Fethiye
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Day 1

Start your trip in Fethiye, known for its stunning
coastline, clear waters, and historic landmarks.
This luxury marina offers a prime location for
yacht charters, with all the amenities and
services needed for a comfortable and enjoyable
experience, including a swimming pool, spa, and
gourmet restaurants. With easy access to nearby
islands and beaches, Fethiye Ece Marina is a
must-visit destination for luxury yacht charters
in Turkey.
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Day 2

Nestled along the southwestern coast of Turkey,
Oludeniz beckons with its mesmerizing azure
waters and pristine beaches. Framed by rugged
cliffs and lush pine forests, this coastal haven
offers a serene escape for beach lovers and
adventure seekers alike. Dive into the crystal-
clear waters for a refreshing swim, or embark on
a paragliding adventure from the nearby
Babadag Mountain for breath-taking aerial
views.
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Day 3

This idyllic haven, only accessible by boat, offers
untouched natural beauty. Nestled between
towering cliffs, the valley is home to diverse flora
and fauna, including the unique Jersey Tiger
butterfly. Take a refreshing swim in the
crystalline waters or explore walking trails
leading to enchanting waterfalls. A stop at
Butterfly Valley promises an escape into serene
and unspoiled nature, making it a must-visit on
any luxury charter itinerary.
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Day 4

Kalkan is a picturesque fishing town on the
Turkish Riviera, known for its stunning views,
crystal-clear waters, and charming marina. The
town is a popular destination for luxury yacht
charters, thanks to its secluded coves and
unspoiled nature.
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Day 5

Kekova is a place where the past and present
seamlessly blend into a breathtaking landscape.
This enchanting region is known for its crystal-
clear turquoise waters, picturesque bays, and the
intriguing remains of the sunken city of Simena.
The tranquil charm of Kekova draws travelers
seeking both natural beauty and historical
wonders. Exploring this coastal paradise, one can
witness the partially submerged ancient ruins
beneath the sea, meander through charming
villages, and experience the warmth of Turkish
hospitality. Kekova is a place where time seems
to stand still, inviting visitors to savor the beauty
of the Mediterranean coast and immerse
themselves in its rich history.
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Day 6

Step back in time while enjoying modern-day
luxury with a visit to Demre, an ancient town on
Turkey's stunning Lycian coast. Once known as
Myra, the town boasts impressive ruins,
including Roman theaters and intricate rock-cut
tombs. But it's not just history that makes Demre
a must-visit; the area is also renowned for its
crystal-clear waters, perfect for diving and
snorkeling. A short distance offshore, you'll find
the sunken city of Simena, offering an
underwater adventure like no other. Whether
you're a history buff or a lover of natural beauty,
Demre provides a uniquely enriching experience.
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Day 7

Kaputaş Beach is renowned for its incredible
natural beauty. It features a small, sandy cove
nestled between towering cliffs and offers clear
turquoise waters. The beach is a favorite among
tourists and locals alike, and its picturesque
setting makes it a great spot for swimming and
sunbathing. Access to the beach involves
descending a steep flight of stairs from the
roadside parking area, which adds to its allure.
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Day 8

As the sun rises over the turquoise waters of the
Mediterranean, our coastal voyage draws to a
close in the charming harbor town of Fethiye.
After a leisurely breakfast on board, it's time to
bid adieu to the yacht and the memories of our
maritime odyssey.
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